

Opening Date -- 7/9/15  
Date Reviewed -- 7/15/2015

CITY OF TROY  
BID TABULATION  
TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:

				Garden State Highway Products, Inc.	Dornbos Sign & Safety Inc.	Osburn Associates, Inc.
				Vineland, NJ	Chalotte, MI	Logan, OH
ITEM	EST	QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
<b>PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM</b>						
1.	25	36"	YIELD (R1-2)	\$ 16.98	\$ 17.00	\$ 19.13
2.	30	30"	STOP (R1-1)	\$ 24.54	\$ 25.00	\$ 26.00
3.	10	36"	STOP (R1-1)	\$ 34.66	\$ 33.35	\$ 38.25
4.	10	18" x 6"	All Way (R1-4)	\$ 4.07	\$ 3.10	\$ 3.19
5.	500	12" x 12"	No Parking (R8-3A)	\$ 4.63	\$ 4.55	\$ 4.25
<b>PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 3,863.00	\$ 3,814.50	\$ 3,797.65
<b>PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY</b>						
1.	500	12" X 12"	No parking Symbol	\$ 1.69	\$ 2.50	\$ 1.80
2.	10	30"	Stop Faces	\$ 9.74	\$ 11.75	\$ 9.98
3.	10	36"	Yield Faces	\$ 5.46	\$ 9.00	\$ 14.40
<b>PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 997.00	\$ 1,457.50	\$ 1,143.80
<b>PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN ON ALUMINUM</b>						
1.	10	30"	School Sign FYG	\$ 19.32	\$ 36.08	\$ 34.38
2.	10	36"	School Sign FYG	\$ 27.81	\$ 51.81	\$ 49.50
3.	10	24" x 12"	Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)	\$ 6.18	\$ 13.87	\$ 10.98
4.	10	24" x 24"	Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)	\$ 12.36	\$ 25.37	\$ 10.98
<b>PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 656.70	\$ 1,271.30	\$ 1,058.40
<b>PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN</b>						
1.	5	96" X 48"	HIP Orange	\$ 127.91	\$ 175.00	\$ 136.00
2.	5	96" x 48"	HIP White	\$ 127.91	\$ 189.00	\$ 136.00
<b>PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 1,279.10	\$ 1,820.00	\$ 1,360.00
<b>PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS</b>						
1.	10	9" X 24"		\$ 8.38	\$ 6.18	\$ 6.38
2.	10	9" X 30"		\$ 10.48	\$ 7.81	\$ 7.97
3.	10	9" X 36"		\$ 12.57	\$ 9.34	\$ 9.56
4.	10	9" X 48"		\$ 16.75	\$ 12.45	\$ 12.75
5.	10	12" X 12"		\$ 4.49	\$ 4.10	\$ 4.25
6.	100	12" X 18"		\$ 6.11	\$ 6.14	\$ 6.38
7.	10	12" X 24"		\$ 7.99	\$ 8.18	\$ 8.50
8.	10	12" X 30"		\$ 9.98	\$ 10.38	\$ 10.63
9.	150	12" X 36"		\$ 11.98	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.75
10.	25	12" X 42"		\$ 13.97	\$ 14.53	\$ 14.88
11.	50	12" X 48"		\$ 15.98	\$ 16.60	\$ 17.00
12.	25	12" X 54"		\$ 17.96	\$ 18.68	\$ 19.13
13.	25	18" X 18"		\$ 8.99	\$ 9.34	\$ 9.56
14.	20	18" X 24"		\$ 11.98	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.77
15.	20	18" X 48"		\$ 15.98	\$ 35.28	\$ 25.50
16.	20	18" X 60"		\$ 19.98	\$ 44.10	\$ 31.88
17.	10	24" X 24"		\$ 15.98	\$ 16.60	\$ 17.00
18.	200	24" X 30"		\$ 19.98	\$ 20.45	\$ 21.25
19.	10	24" X 36"		\$ 23.98	\$ 24.90	\$ 25.50
20.	10	24" X 48"		\$ 31.97	\$ 33.20	\$ 34.00
21.	200	30" X 30"		\$ 24.98	\$ 25.94	\$ 26.56
22.	10	36" X 36"		\$ 35.96	\$ 37.35	\$ 38.25
<b>PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 15,966.10	\$ 17,179.45	\$ 17,202.65
<b>PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM</b>						
1.	10	12" X 12"	Two Color	\$ 4.63	\$ 4.15	\$ 4.35
2.	50	12" X 18"	Two Color	\$ 6.29	\$ 6.02	\$ 6.53
3.	10	24" x 24"	Two Color	\$ 16.46	\$ 16.05	\$ 17.40
4.	10	30" X 30"	Three Color	\$ 27.82	\$ 28.45	\$ 28.13
<b>PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 803.60	\$ 787.50	\$ 825.30

CITY OF TROY  
 BID TABULATION  
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:		Garden State Highway Products, Inc.	Dornbos Sign & Safety Inc.	Osburn Associates, Inc.
		Vineland, NJ	Chalotte, MI	Logan, OH
ITEM	EST QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
<b>PROPOSAL G: COMPLETE SIGNS, DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC TWO SIDED ON WHITE ON EXTRUDED ALUMINUM</b>				
1.	25	9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film)	\$ 10.26	\$ 5.58
2.	25	9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film)	\$ 12.83	\$ 8.95
3.	25	9" X 36" Extruded BLANK (no film)	\$ 15.39	\$ 11.12
4.	25	9" X 42" Extruded BLANK (no film)	\$ 17.96	\$ 13.28
5.	25	9" X 48" Extruded BLANK (No Film)	\$ 20.53	\$ 14.49
<b>PROPOSAL G: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 1,924.25	\$ 1,335.50
<b>PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES</b>			\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
<b>PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID, 2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS. PER LINEAL FOOT.</b>				
1.	100	12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post	\$ 41.38	\$ 51.10
<b>PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 4,138.00	\$ 5,110.00
<b>PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS</b>				
1.	200	10 FT - 2lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 20.24	\$ 14.50
2.	200	12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 29.49	\$ 26.05
3.	100	15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 36.86	\$ 32.00
<b>PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 13,632.00	\$ 11,310.00
<b>PROPOSAL K: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED</b>				
1.	100	14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge	\$ 26.48	\$ 28.40
2.	300	12 FT x 2" - 12 Gauge	\$ 32.16	\$ 39.14
3.	300	10 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge	\$ 26.81	\$ 32.66
4.	300	9 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge	\$ 24.60	\$ 29.40
5.	100	3 FT X2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 8.61	\$ 9.56
6.	1000	3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 10.27	\$ 11.83
<b>PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 38,850.00	\$ 45,986.00
<b>ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:</b>			\$ 82,109.75	\$ 90,071.75
DELIVERY:	Minimum Shipment	\$500.00	Blank	\$1,000.00 *Posts: 6-8 weeks delivery time
	# of Days	21-30	30	30
CONTACT INFO:	Hrs of Operation:	Mon-Fri 7am-5pm	7:30am-5:00pm	8am-5pm
	24 Hr Phone Number:	609-774-1116	517-543-4000	800-523-8917
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:	Marked	N	N	specs
PAYMENT TERMS:		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30 days
WARRANTY:		Blank	3M Warranty	10 years
EXCEPTIONS:		Blank	Blank	Blank
FORMS INCLUDED:	Legal Status Bidder	Y	Y	Y
	Non-Collusion Affidavit	Y	Y	Y
	Debarment Certification	Y	Y	Y
	Iran-Linked Business	Y	Y	Y
ALL OR NONE AWARD:	Y or N	N	N	N
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED:	Y or N	Y	Y	Y

CITY OF TROY  
 BID TABULATION  
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:

**Lightle Enterprises of  
 Ohio, LLC**  
**Frankfort, OH**  
 UNIT PRICE

**Vulcan, Inc. (DBA  
 Vulcan Signs)**  
**Foley, AL**  
 UNIT PRICE

**Rocal, Inc.**  
**Frankfort, OH**  
 UNIT PRICE

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION

**PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM**

1.	25	36" YIELD	(R1-2)	\$21.42	\$	16.11	\$	20.06
2.	30	30" STOP	(R1-1)	\$26.60	\$	21.98	\$	28.94
3.	10	36" STOP	(R1-1)	\$42.60	\$	31.85	\$	41.67
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way	(R1-4)	\$3.60	\$	3.44	\$	5.47
5.	500	12" x 12" No Parking	(R8-3A)	\$4.80	\$	4.44	\$	6.63
<b>PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 4,195.50	\$	3,635.05	\$	5,156.10

**PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY**

1.	500	12" X 12" No parking Symbol		\$ 2.10	\$	2.11	\$	1.99
2.	10	30" Stop Faces		\$ 12.38	\$	10.19	\$	12.44
3.	10	36" Yield Faces		\$ 8.92	\$	6.64	\$	9.76
<b>PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 1,263.00	\$	1,223.30	\$	1,217.00

**PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN ON ALUMINUM**

1.	10	30" School Sign FYG		\$ 23.88	\$	34.01	\$	40.50
2.	10	36" School Sign FYG		\$ 34.38	\$	49.20	\$	58.32
3.	10	24" x 12" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)		\$ 7.64	\$	11.61	\$	12.96
4.	10	24" x 24" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)		\$ 14.28	\$	25.42	\$	25.92
<b>PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 801.80	\$	1,202.40	\$	1,377.00

**PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN**

1.	5	96" X 48" HIP Orange		\$ 208.00		NO BID	\$	255.04
2.	5	96" x 48" HIP White		\$ 208.00		NO BID	\$	255.04
<b>PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 2,080.00			\$	2,550.40

**PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS**

1.	10	9" X 24"		\$ 7.14	\$	5.77	\$	6.95
2.	10	9" X 30"		\$ 8.93	\$	7.10	\$	8.68
3.	10	9" X 36"		\$ 10.71	\$	8.50	\$	10.42
4.	10	9" X 48"		\$ 14.28	\$	11.33	\$	13.89
5.	10	12" X 12"		\$ 4.76	\$	3.91	\$	6.63
6.	100	12" X 18"		\$ 7.14	\$	5.78	\$	6.95
7.	10	12" X 24"		\$ 9.52	\$	7.54	\$	9.26
8.	10	12" X 30"		\$ 11.90	\$	9.39	\$	11.58
9.	150	12" X 36"		\$ 14.28	\$	10.83	\$	13.89
10.	25	12" X 42"		\$ 16.66	\$	12.64	\$	16.21
11.	50	12" X 48"		\$ 19.04	\$	14.44	\$	18.52
12.	25	12" X 54"		\$ 21.42	\$	16.25	\$	20.84
13.	25	18" X 18"		\$ 10.71	\$	8.45	\$	10.42
14.	20	18" X 24"		\$ 14.28	\$	10.83	\$	13.89
15.	20	18" X 48"		\$ 28.56	\$	21.66	\$	27.78
16.	20	18" X 60"		\$ 35.70	\$	27.08	\$	34.73
17.	10	24" X 24"		\$ 19.04	\$	14.44	\$	18.52
18.	200	24" X 30"		\$ 23.80	\$	18.05	\$	23.15
19.	10	24" X 36"		\$ 28.56	\$	21.66	\$	27.78
20.	10	24" X 48"		\$ 38.08	\$	28.88	\$	37.04
21.	200	30" X 30"		\$ 29.75	\$	22.56	\$	28.94
22.	10	36" X 36"		\$ 42.84	\$	32.49	\$	41.67
<b>PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 19,266.15	\$	14,681.50	\$	18,761.45

**PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM**

1.	10	12" X 12" Two Color		\$ 4.88	\$	4.34	\$	6.94
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color		\$ 7.32	\$	6.21	\$	7.41
3.	10	24" x 24" Two Color		\$ 19.52	\$	14.83	\$	19.76
4.	10	30" X 30" Three Color		\$ 30.50	\$	23.36	\$	36.69
<b>PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 915.00	\$	735.80	\$	1,004.40

CITY OF TROY  
 BID TABULATION  
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:	<b>Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC</b> Frankfort, OH	<b>Vulcan, Inc. (DBA Vulcan Signs)</b> Foley, AL	<b>Rocal, Inc.</b> Frankfort, OH
	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION

**PROPOSAL G: COMPLETE SIGNS, DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC TWO SIDED ON WHITE ON EXTRUDED ALUMINUM**

1.	25	9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film)	\$ 25.43	\$ 5.70	\$ 28.90
2.	25	9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film)	\$ 31.78	\$ 7.10	\$ 36.12
3.	25	9" X 36" Extruded BLANK (no film)	\$ 38.14	\$ 8.50	\$ 38.50
4.	25	9" X 42" Extruded BLANK (no film)	\$ 44.49	\$ 9.98	\$ 44.91
5.	25	9" X 48" Extruded BLANK (No Film)	\$ 50.85	\$ 11.30	\$ 51.33
<b>PROPOSAL G: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 4,767.25	\$ 1,064.50	\$ 4,994.00

**PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES**

	\$ 40.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 100.00
--	----------	----------	-----------

**PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID, 2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS. PER LINEAL FOOT.**

1.	100	12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post	\$ 20.16	NO BID	NO BID
<b>PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 2,016.00		

**PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS**

1.	200	10 FT - 2lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 19.60	\$ 18.34	NO BID
2.	200	12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 33.60	\$ 32.60	
3.	100	15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 42.00	\$ 41.57	
<b>PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 14,840.00	\$ 14,345.00	

**PROPOSAL K: SWUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED**

1.	100	14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge	\$ 31.12	\$ 26.26	NO BID
2.	300	12 FT x 2" - 12 Gauge	\$ 36.48	\$ 31.42	
3.	300	10 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge	\$ 30.40	\$ 26.18	
4.	300	9 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge	\$ 27.36	\$ 23.57	
5.	100	3 FT X2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 9.20	\$ 8.92	
6.	1000	3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 10.63	\$ 9.94	
<b>PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ 42,934.00	\$ 37,809.00	

**ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:**

	\$ 93,078.70	\$ 74,696.55	\$ 35,060.35
--	--------------	--------------	--------------

DELIVERY:	Minimum Shipment	\$2,000.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
	# of Days	30-45 ARO	Stock items 3-5 days. See bid for more details.	30-45
CONTACT INFO:	Hrs of Operation:	8am-5pm	7am-4pm Central Time	7am-4:30pm
	24 Hr Phone Number:	740-703-6740	800-633-6845	800-992-8633
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:	Marked	Blank	Blank	A, B
PAYMENT TERMS:		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
WARRANTY:		Per reflective sheeting manufacturer standard	Standard warranty applies	Labor - 1 year Materials - 10 years
EXCEPTIONS:		Blank	Proposal G - We are quoting bare metal (no sheeting) extruded blanks.	We are bidding Avery Dennison series 6500 HIP for Proposals A, B, D, E, and F. We are bidding Avery Dennison series 9500 OmniView for Proposals C and G. Product Bulletins are attached.
FORMS INCLUDED:	Legal Status Bidder	Y	Y	Y
	Non-Collusion Affidavit	Y	Y	Y
	Debarment Certification	Y	Y	Y
	Iran-Linked Business	Y	Y	Y
ALL OR NONE AWARD:	Y or N	N	N	N
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED:	Y or N	Y	Y	Y

CITY OF TROY  
 BID TABULATION  
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:

Custom Products Corporation Jackson, MS UNIT PRICE	Rathco Safety Supply, Inc. Portage, MI UNIT PRICE	MD Solutions Plain City, OH UNIT PRICE
--	---	--

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION

**PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM**

1.	25	36" YIELD (R1-2)	\$ 16.87	\$ 17.51	NO BID
2.	30	30" STOP (R1-1)	\$ 23.35	\$ 24.66	
3.	10	36" STOP (R1-1)	\$ 33.65	\$ 34.16	
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)	\$ 3.30	\$ 3.40	
5.	500	12" x 12" No Parking (R8-3A)	\$ 3.80	\$ 4.49	
<b>PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 3,391.75</b>	<b>\$ 3,798.15</b>	

**PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY**

1.	500	12" X 12" No parking Symbol	\$ 2.35	\$ 2.45	NO BID
2.	10	30" Stop Faces	\$ 11.63	\$ 11.25	
3.	10	36" Yield Faces	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.85	
<b>PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 1,366.30</b>	<b>\$ 1,416.00</b>	

**PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN ON ALUMINUM**

1.	10	30" School Sign FYG	\$ 48.53	\$ 36.50	NO BID
2.	10	36" School Sign FYG	\$ 74.81	\$ 49.59	
3.	10	24" x 12" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)	\$ 16.17	\$ 11.10	
4.	10	24" x 24" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)	\$ 36.00	\$ 22.20	
<b>PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 1,755.10</b>	<b>\$ 1,193.90</b>	

**PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN**

1.	5	96" X 48" HIP Orange	NO BID	\$ 199.75	NO BID
2.	5	96" x 48" HIP White		\$ 226.85	
<b>PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL --</b>				<b>\$ 2,133.00</b>	

**PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS**

1.	10	9" X 24"	\$ 6.02	\$ 6.45	NO BID
2.	10	9" X 30"	\$ 7.52	\$ 8.06	
3.	10	9" X 36"	\$ 9.02	\$ 9.64	
4.	10	9" X 48"	\$ 12.03	\$ 12.90	
5.	10	12" X 12"	\$ 4.20	\$ 4.24	
6.	100	12" X 18"	\$ 6.03	\$ 6.53	
7.	10	12" X 24"	\$ 8.02	\$ 8.20	
8.	10	12" X 30"	\$ 10.03	\$ 9.88	
9.	150	12" X 36"	\$ 12.03	\$ 12.30	
10.	25	12" X 42"	\$ 14.04	\$ 14.35	
11.	50	12" X 48"	\$ 16.04	\$ 16.40	
12.	25	12" X 54"	\$ 18.18	\$ 18.45	
13.	25	18" X 18"	\$ 9.03	\$ 9.23	
14.	20	18" X 24"	\$ 12.03	\$ 12.30	
15.	20	18" X 48"	\$ 24.06	\$ 24.60	
16.	20	18" X 60"	\$ 29.63	\$ 30.75	
17.	10	24" X 24"	\$ 16.04	\$ 16.40	
18.	200	24" X 30"	\$ 19.55	\$ 20.50	
19.	10	24" X 36"	\$ 23.46	\$ 24.26	
20.	10	24" X 48"	\$ 31.28	\$ 32.80	
21.	200	30" X 30"	\$ 24.44	\$ 25.63	
22.	10	36" X 36"	\$ 36.00	\$ 36.90	
<b>PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 15,989.35</b>	<b>\$ 16,645.05</b>	

**PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM**

1.	10	12" X 12" Two Color	\$ 11.50	\$ 4.54	NO BID
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color	\$ 12.84	\$ 6.74	
3.	10	24" x 24" Two Color	\$ 32.00	\$ 13.86	
4.	10	30" X 30" Three Color	\$ 53.00	\$ 29.74	
<b>PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 1,607.00</b>	<b>\$ 818.40</b>	

CITY OF TROY  
 BID TABULATION  
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:	<b>Custom Products Corporation</b> Jackson, MS	<b>Rathco Safety Supply, Inc.</b> Portage, MI	<b>MD Solutions</b> Plain City, OH
	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION

**PROPOSAL G: COMPLETE SIGNS, DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC TWO SIDED ON WHITE ON EXTRUDED ALUMINUM**

1.	25	9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film)	NO BID	\$	11.50	NO BID
2.	25	9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film)		\$	14.37	
3.	25	9" X 36" Extruded BLANK (no film)		\$	17.24	
4.	25	9" X 42" Extruded BLANK (no film)		\$	20.11	
5.	25	9" X 48" Extruded BLANK (No Film)		\$	22.99	
<b>PROPOSAL G: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$	2,155.25	

**PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES**

	\$	35.00	NO BID	NO BID
--	----	-------	--------	--------

**PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID, 2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS. PER LINEAL FOOT.**

1.	100	12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --</b>					

**PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS**

1.	200	10 FT - 2lbs Galvanized Steel	\$	17.96	\$	15.20	\$	16.32
2.	200	12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel	\$	34.15	\$	26.28	\$	27.40
3.	100	15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel	\$	56.88	\$	32.85	\$	32.90
<b>PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$	16,110.00	\$	11,581.00	\$	12,034.00

**PROPOSAL K: SWUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED**

1.	100	14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge	NO BID	NO BID	\$	27.05
2.	300	12 FT x 2" - 12 Gauge			\$	33.60
3.	300	10 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge			\$	28.00
4.	300	9 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge			\$	25.20
5.	100	3 FT X2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge			\$	9.50
6.	1000	3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge			\$	10.28
<b>PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL --</b>					\$	39,975.00

**ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:**

	\$	40,219.50	\$	39,740.75	\$	52,009.00
--	----	-----------	----	-----------	----	-----------

DELIVERY:	Minimum Shipment	\$500 & post must be ordered in full bundles of (50)	\$500.00	\$2,500.00
	# of Days	35; post up to 65	30	30
CONTACT INFO:	Hrs of Operation:	7am-5pm	8am-4pm	8:30am-5pm
	24 Hr Phone Number:	None / 7am-5pm: 888-905-5665	n/a	Blank
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:	Marked	#8 Catalog	Blank	Blank
PAYMENT TERMS:		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
WARRANTY:		3m Warranty applies	3M Sheeting	Standard
EXCEPTIONS:		1) Post must be ordered in full bundles. See bid for more.	Blank	Blank
FORMS INCLUDED:	Legal Status Bidder	Y	Y	Y
	Non-Collusion Affidavit	Y	Y	Y
	Debarment Certification	Y	Y	Y
	Iran-Linked Business	Y	Y	Y
ALL OR NONE AWARD:	Y or N	N	N	N
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED:	Y or N	Y	Y	Y

ATTEST:  
 Enna Bachelor  
 Saraa Teets  
 Susan Riesterer

MaryBeth Murz  
 Purchasing Manager