

VENDOR NAME: jh

				Custom Products	Michigan	Rocal, Inc.	Vulcan Signs
				Corporation	State Industries		
ITEM	EST QTY	DESCRIPTION		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
<b>PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM</b>							
1.	50	36" YIELD (R1-2)		\$ 15.24	\$ 33.55	\$ 18.69	\$ 15.99
2.	50	30" STOP (R1-1)		\$ 22.52	\$ 35.40	\$ 24.75	\$ 22.64
3.	10	36" STOP (R1-1)		\$ 31.96	\$ 51.25	\$ 35.64	\$ 32.68
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)		\$ 3.91	\$ 4.80	\$ 2.97	\$ 3.30
<b>PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL --</b>				<b>\$ 2,246.70</b>	\$ 4,008.00	\$ 2,558.10	\$ 2,291.30
<b>PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent Yellow Green</b>							
1.	10	36" S2-1 School Crossing		\$ 64.42	\$ 45.65	\$ 57.60	\$ 61.60
2.	10	24" X 12" W 16-7 Left School Arrow		\$ 15.11	\$ 10.90	\$ 12.80	\$ 14.44
3.	10	36" S1-1 Cross Walk		\$ 64.42	\$ 45.65	\$ 57.60	\$ 61.60
<b>PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 1,439.50	<b>\$ 1,022.00</b>	\$ 1,280.00	\$ 1,376.40
<b>PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN</b>							
1.	10	12" X 18" One Color		\$ 6.11	\$ 7.85	\$ 5.94	\$ 5.77
2.	20	12" X 36" One Color		\$ 11.42	\$ 14.35	\$ 11.88	\$ 11.31
3.	30	18" X 18" One Color		\$ 9.15	\$ 11.15	\$ 8.91	\$ 8.48
4.	20	24" X 24" One Color		\$ 15.23	\$ 19.25	\$ 15.84	\$ 15.08
5.	50	24" X 30" One Color		\$ 18.98	\$ 24.25	\$ 19.80	\$ 18.85
6.	50	30" X 30" One Color		\$ 23.24	\$ 30.85	\$ 24.75	\$ 23.56
7.	10	36" X 36" One Color		\$ 33.10	\$ 41.85	\$ 35.64	\$ 33.93
8.	10	48" X 48" One Color		\$ 58.53	\$ 75.75	\$ 63.36	\$ 60.32
9.	50	12" X 30" High Intensity		\$ 9.50	\$ 14.30	\$ 9.90	\$ 10.29
10.	50	12" X 36" High Intensity		\$ 11.42	\$ 14.35	\$ 11.88	\$ 11.31
11.	50	12" X 48" High Intensity		\$ 15.23	\$ 18.40	\$ 15.84	\$ 15.08
12.	20	12" X 54" High Intensity		\$ 17.10	\$ 21.00	\$ 17.82	\$ 16.97
13.	10	12" X 60" High Intensity		\$ 18.98	\$ 23.00	\$ 19.80	\$ 18.85
<b>PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL --</b>				<b>\$ 6,235.20</b>	\$ 8,018.50	\$ 6,534.00	\$ 6,264.80
<b>PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS- SIGN</b>							
1.	200	12" X 12" Two Color		\$ 5.40	\$ 5.50	\$ 4.19	\$ 4.53
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color		\$ 6.52	\$ 7.85	\$ 6.29	\$ 6.20
<b>PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 1,406.00	\$ 1,492.50	<b>\$ 1,152.50</b>	\$ 1,216.00
<b>PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES</b>							
1.	500	12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Faces		\$ 3.13	\$ 5.50	\$ 1.68	\$ 2.20
2.	20	30" Stop Faces		\$ 11.31	\$ 35.40	\$ 10.50	\$ 11.00
3.	20	36" Stop Faces		\$ 16.06	\$ 51.25	\$ 15.12	\$ 15.84
4.	20	36" Yield Faces		\$ 7.79	\$ 33.55	\$ 9.80	\$ 7.02
5.	20	24" x 24" No Parking R8-3A Faces		\$ 8.26	\$ 19.25	\$ 6.72	\$ 7.49
<b>PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 2,433.40	\$ 5,539.00	<b>\$ 1,682.80</b>	\$ 1,927.00
<b>PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN</b>							
1.	40	9" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ 16.65	\$ -	\$ 28.38	\$ 11.97
2.	40	9" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ 19.99	\$ -	\$ 31.21	\$ 14.38
3.	40	9" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ 23.34	\$ -	\$ 34.12	\$ 16.78
4.	40	6" X 24" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ 8.76	\$ -	\$ 21.15	\$ 6.60
5.	50	6" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ 10.97	\$ -	\$ 22.94	\$ 8.27
6.	50	6" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ 13.05	\$ -	\$ 24.73	\$ 9.90
7.	50	6" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ 15.24	\$ -	\$ 26.51	\$ 11.56
8.	50	24" x 30" 3M Scotchlite on Aluminum		\$ 26.10	\$ 38.30	\$ 29.95	\$ 29.31
<b>PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 6,017.60	\$ 1,915.00	\$ 9,800.90	<b>\$ 4,941.20</b>

Opening Date -- 1/07/10  
Date Prepared -- 1/07/10

CITY OF TROY  
BID TABULATION  
**TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS**

ITB-COT 09-48  
Pg. 2 of 8

VENDOR NAME:

				Custom Products Corporation	Michigan State Industries	Rocal, Inc.	Vulcan Signs
<b>PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES</b>				\$ 75.00	\$ -	\$1.50 / Sq Ft	\$ - **
<b>PROPOSAL H: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED</b>					Blank	NO BID	*See Below
1.	100	12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge		\$ 22.26	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21.23
2.	100	9 Ft X 1 1/2" - 14 Gauge	*	\$ 17.28	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 16.52 ***
3.	100	3 Ft X 2 " Base - 12 Gauge		\$ 8.68	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.88
4.	100	3 Ft X 1 3/4 " Base - 12 Gauge		\$ 8.67	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.66
* Item 2 - 12 Gauge							*** 12 Gauge Only
<b>PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 5,689.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,229.00
<b>PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS</b>					N/A	NO BID	NO BID
1.	100	12 FT Galvanized steel round post		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
<b>PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
<b>PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS</b>					N/A	NO BID	NO BID
1.	50	12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel		\$ 26.94	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 27.72
2.	100	12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel		\$ 22.99	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 23.40
3.	100	10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel		\$ 12.27	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.57
<b>PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 4,873.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,883.00
<b>OPTIONAL:</b>					N/A		
<b>PROPOSAL K: Complete Signs, Single Face 3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000</b>							
1.	50	36" Yield (R1-2)		\$ 29.18	\$ 75.80	DMS	\$ 28.04
2.	50	30" Stop (R1-1)		\$ 43.77	\$ 64.75		\$ 42.02
3.	10	36" Stop (R1-1)		\$ 62.56	\$ 93.50		\$ 60.60
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)		\$ 6.46	\$ 8.30		\$ 5.62
<b>PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 4,337.70	\$ 8,045.50	DMS	\$ 4,165.20
<b>ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:</b>				\$ 8,481.90	\$ 1,022.00	\$ 2,835.30	\$ 4,941.20
DELIVERY:		Minimum Shipment # of Days		\$1,000.00	\$1,000 or less	\$500.00	\$50.00
				30 to 45	30 - 60	30-45 Days	3-5 days - stock
							30 Day - non-stock
CONTACT INFO:		Hrs of Operation:		7 AM to 5 PM	8 AM to 5 PM	8AM to 5PM	7 AM to 4 PM CST
		24 Hr Phone Number:		601-933-8282	517-373-4277	Blank	800-633-6845
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:		Marked		✓	Blank	"X"	Blank
PAYMENT TERMS:				Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
WARRANTY:				www.3m.com/tss	Blank	Sheeting 10 yr Wrkmshp 1 yr	Standard
DELIVERY:				30 - 45 Non stock	30 - 60 Days	30 - 45	3-5 Days -Stock
EXCEPTIONS:				* See attachment		All Sheeting is	*Based on #3930
				3M Diamond Grade	Blank	Avery Dennison	1 Side, no message
				replaced with DG3		Equal to 3M 6500	**Call for pricing on
				Bundles of 50 per order		Series & 9500	Non Standard Signs
						Series = grade	Posts/Bundles of 25
ONE LOT PRICING		Y or N	✓	No	No	No	No
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:		Y or N		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

DMS: Rocal, Inc - Proposal K only - This was an Optional Proposal in order to test a new 3M product - Alternates (substitutes) not acceptable

ATTEST:

Diane Fisher  
Deanna Theobald  
Tom Rosewarne  
Linda Bockstanz

**YELLOW** DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDER BY PROPOSAL

Susan Leirstein CPPO CPPB  
Purchasing Director

Opening Date -- 1/07/10  
 Date Prepared -- 1/07/10

CITY OF TROY  
 BID TABULATION  
**TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS**

VENDOR NAME:

				Allied	Osburn	Dornbos Sign	Rathco Safety
				Municipal Supply	Associates, Inc.	and Safety, Inc	Supply, Inc.
ITEM	EST QTY	DESCRIPTION		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
<b>PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM</b>							
1.	50	36" YIELD (R1-2)		\$ 19.00	\$ 17.87	\$ 23.00	\$ 15.93
2.	50	30" STOP (R1-1)		\$ 23.50	\$ 24.38	\$ 31.94	\$ 25.92
3.	10	36" STOP (R1-1)		\$ 35.00	\$ 35.10	\$ 45.99	\$ 37.34
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)		\$ 3.00	\$ 3.11	\$ 3.83	\$ 3.19
<b>PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 2,505.00	\$ 2,494.60	\$ 3,245.20	\$ 2,497.80
<b>PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent Yellow Green</b>							
1.	10	36" S2-1 School Crossing		\$ 50.00	\$ 62.73	\$ 77.84	\$ 67.39
2.	10	24" X 12" W 16-7 Left School Arrow		\$ 10.60	\$ 13.94	\$ 17.30	\$ 14.98
3.	10	36" S1-1 Cross Walk		\$ 49.80	\$ 62.73	\$ 77.84	\$ 67.39
<b>PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 1,104.00	\$ 1,394.00	\$ 1,729.80	\$ 1,497.60
<b>PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN</b>							
1.	10	12" X 18" One Color		\$ 5.77	\$ 6.23	\$ 7.67	\$ 6.37
2.	20	12" X 36" One Color		\$ 11.56	\$ 11.91	\$ 15.33	\$ 12.74
3.	30	18" X 18" One Color		\$ 9.00	\$ 8.93	\$ 11.50	\$ 9.56
4.	20	24" X 24" One Color		\$ 16.00	\$ 15.88	\$ 20.44	\$ 16.99
5.	50	24" X 30" One Color		\$ 20.00	\$ 19.85	\$ 25.55	\$ 21.23
6.	50	30" X 30" One Color		\$ 24.60	\$ 24.81	\$ 31.94	\$ 26.54
7.	10	36" X 36" One Color		\$ 36.50	\$ 35.73	\$ 45.99	\$ 38.22
8.	10	48" X 48" One Color		\$ 61.51	\$ 63.52	\$ 81.76	\$ 67.95
9.	50	12" X 30" High Intensity		\$ 11.01	\$ 10.88	\$ 12.78	\$ 10.62
10.	50	12" X 36" High Intensity		\$ 12.00	\$ 13.05	\$ 15.33	\$ 12.74
11.	50	12" X 48" High Intensity		\$ 16.28	\$ 17.40	\$ 20.44	\$ 19.11
12.	20	12" X 54" High Intensity		\$ 18.02	\$ 19.58	\$ 23.00	\$ 19.11
13.	10	12" X 60" High Intensity		\$ 20.00	\$ 21.75	\$ 25.55	\$ 21.23
<b>PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 6,613.90	\$ 6,787.10	\$ 8,432.10	\$ 7,113.30
<b>PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS- SIGN</b>							
1.	200	12" X 12" Two Color		\$ 4.98	\$ 4.22	\$ 5.50	\$ 4.25
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color		\$ 6.11	\$ 6.60	\$ 8.44	\$ 6.37
<b>PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 1,301.50	\$ 1,174.00	\$ 1,522.00	\$ 1,168.50
<b>PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES</b>							
1.	500	12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Fac		\$ 1.92	\$ 2.05	\$ 2.69	\$ 1.85
2.	20	30" Stop Faces		\$ 11.06	\$ 10.00	\$ 14.88	\$ 11.55
3.	20	36" Stop Faces		\$ 16.31	\$ 14.40	\$ 21.42	\$ 16.63
4.	20	36" Yield Faces		\$ 9.40	\$ 7.20	\$ 10.71	\$ 6.93
5.	20	24" x 24" No Parking R8-3A Faces		\$ 7.67	\$ 7.48	\$ 10.47	\$ 7.39
<b>PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 1,848.80	\$ 1,806.60	\$ 2,494.60	\$ 1,775.00
<b>PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN</b>							
1.	40	9" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White		NO BID	\$ 13.50	\$ 20.23	\$ 15.68
2.	40	9" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ -	\$ 16.20	\$ 25.69	\$ 18.81
3.	40	9" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ -	\$ 18.90	\$ 28.03	\$ 21.95
4.	40	6" X 24" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ -	\$ 7.50	\$ 12.46	\$ 8.36
5.	50	6" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ -	\$ 9.38	\$ 14.45	\$ 10.45
6.	50	6" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ -	\$ 11.25	\$ 17.21	\$ 12.54
7.	50	6" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White		\$ -	\$ 13.13	\$ 27.44	\$ 14.63
8.	50	24" x 30" 3M Scotchlite on Aluminum		\$ -	\$ 19.85	\$ 25.56	\$ 41.81
<b>PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ -	\$ 4,924.50	\$ 7,689.40	\$ 6,563.50

Opening Date -- 1/07/10  
Date Prepared -- 1/07/10

CITY OF TROY  
BID TABULATION  
**TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS**

VENDOR NAME:

				Allied	Osburn	Dornbos Sign	Rathco Safety
				Municipal Supply	Associates, Inc.	and Safety, Inc	Supply, Inc.
<b>PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES</b>				\$ -	\$ 60.00	\$ 20.00	
				No set up fee	NO BID		
<b>PROPOSAL H: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED</b>							
1.	100	12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge		\$ 16.74	\$ -	\$ 28.50	\$ 35.95
2.	100	9 Ft X 1 1/2" - 14 Gauge		\$ 11.10	\$ -	\$ 24.00	\$ 29.15
3.	100	3 Ft X 2" Base - 12 Gauge		\$ 6.75	\$ -	\$ 11.75	\$ 12.50
4.	100	3 Ft X 1 3/4" Base - 12 Gauge		\$ 5.80	\$ -	\$ 8.50	\$ 11.25
<b>PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL --</b>				<b>\$ 4,039.00</b>	\$ -	\$ 7,275.00	\$ 8,885.00
				NO BID	NO BID		
<b>PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS</b>							
1.	100	12 FT Galvanized steel round post		\$ 25.84	\$ -	\$ 53.00	\$ -
<b>PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --</b>				<b>\$ 2,584.00</b>	\$ -	\$ 5,300.00	\$ -
<b>PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS</b>					NO BID		
1.	50	12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel		\$ 26.10	\$ 28.44	\$ 29.30	\$ 27.00
2.	100	12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel		\$ 21.45	\$ 21.25	\$ 23.53	\$ 22.20
3.	100	10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel		\$ 13.50	\$ 11.80	\$ 13.08	\$ 13.10
<b>PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 4,800.00	<b>\$ 4,727.00</b>	\$ 5,126.00	\$ 4,880.00
<b>OPTIONAL:</b>						NO BID	NO BID
<b>PROPOSAL K: Complete Signs, Single Face 3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000</b>							
1.	50	36" Yield (R1-2)		\$ -	\$ 30.38	\$ 27.45	\$ 27.15
2.	50	30" Stop (R1-1)		\$ -	\$ 41.75	\$ 38.10	\$ 44.65
3.	10	36" Stop (R1-1)		\$ -	\$ 60.12	\$ 59.75	\$ 64.29
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)		\$ -	\$ 5.25	\$ 6.08	\$ 5.43
<b>PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ -	\$ 4,260.20	<b>\$ 3,935.80</b>	\$ 4,287.20
<b>ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:</b>				<b>\$ 6,623.00</b>	<b>\$ 4,727.00</b>	<b>\$ 3,935.80</b>	N/A
DELIVERY:	Minimum Shipment		\$50.00	\$1,000.00	\$750.00	\$1,000.00	
	# of Days		30	30	21 Working	30	
CONTACT INFO:	Hrs of Operation:		7 AM to 4 PM	M-F 8 AM to 5 PM	7:30 AM to 4:30 PM	7 AM to 5 PM	
	24 Hr Phone Number:		217-824-4864	800-523-8917	800-922-0029	269-323-0153	
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:	Marked		"X"	Blank	"X"	Blank	
PAYMENT TERMS:			30 Days	Net 30	Net 20	Net 30 Days	
WARRANTY:			3M Manufacturer	Sheeting Mfg Warranty 10 yr - HIP	3M	Blank	
DELIVERY:			30 Days	30 Days ARO	21-30	30 Days	
EXCEPTIONS:			Blank	Blank	Blank	Blank	
ONE LOT PRICING	Y or N	✓	No	No	No	No	
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:	Y or N		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	

**NO BIDS:**

Hall Signs  
American Traffic Safety Mats, Inc.  
Newman Signs, Inc.

**YELLOW** DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDER BY PROPOSAL

VENDOR NAME:

Central Sign and Fabricating	Sign A Rama Brighton	Unistrut Detroit Service Co.	Signwire Worldwise, Inc.
---------------------------------	-------------------------	---------------------------------	-----------------------------

ITEM	EST QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
------	---------	-------------	------------	------------	------------	------------

<b>PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM</b>				<b>NO BID</b>			
1.	50	36" YIELD (R1-2)	\$ 67.38	\$ 64.40	\$ -	\$ 71.85	
2.	50	30" STOP (R1-1)	\$ 46.79	\$ 89.60	\$ -	\$ 50.76	
3.	10	36" STOP (R1-1)	\$ 67.38	\$ 133.00	\$ -	\$ 71.85	
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)	\$ 4.80	\$ 30.80	\$ -	\$ 8.60	
<b>PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 6,430.30</b>	<b>\$ 9,338.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 6,935.00</b>	

<b>PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent Yellow Green</b>				<b>NO BID</b>			
1.	10	36" S2-1 School Crossing	\$ 67.38	\$ 252.00	\$ -	\$ 98.20	
2.	10	24" X 12" W 16-7 Left School Arrow	\$ 8.32	\$ 67.20	\$ -	\$ 32.85	
3.	10	36" S1-1 Cross Walk	\$ 67.38	\$ 252.00	\$ -	\$ 98.20	
<b>PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 1,430.80</b>	<b>\$ 5,712.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 2,292.50</b>	

<b>PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN</b>				<b>NO BID</b>			
1.	10	12" X 18" One Color	\$ 11.84	\$ 30.80	\$ -	\$ 14.35	
2.	20	12" X 36" One Color	\$ 22.46	\$ 56.00	\$ -	\$ 25.85	
3.	30	18" X 18" One Color	\$ 17.12	\$ 42.00	\$ -	\$ 17.25	
4.	20	24" X 24" One Color	\$ 29.95	\$ 67.20	\$ -	\$ 33.50	
5.	50	24" X 30" One Color	\$ 37.44	\$ 84.00	\$ -	\$ 41.20	
6.	50	30" X 30" One Color	\$ 46.79	\$ 92.40	\$ -	\$ 50.76	
7.	10	36" X 36" One Color	\$ 67.38	\$ 128.80	\$ -	\$ 71.98	
8.	10	48" X 48" One Color	\$ 119.79	\$ 228.20	\$ -	\$ 92.00	
9.	50	12" X 30" High Intensity	\$ 18.88	\$ 58.80	\$ -	\$ 39.00	
10.	50	12" X 36" High Intensity	\$ 22.46	\$ 51.80	\$ -	\$ 38.66	
11.	50	12" X 48" High Intensity	\$ 29.95	\$ 112.00	\$ -	\$ 44.50	
12.	20	12" X 54" High Intensity	\$ 33.69	\$ 151.20	\$ -	\$ 43.50	
13.	10	12" X 60" High Intensity	\$ 37.44	\$ 161.00	\$ -	\$ 50.33	
<b>PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 12,376.10</b>	<b>\$ 32,186.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 15,567.10</b>	

<b>PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS- SIGN</b>				<b>NO BID</b>			
1.	200	12" X 12" Two Color	\$ 8.32	\$ 20.44	\$ -	\$ 4.98	
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color	\$ 11.84	\$ 22.12	\$ -	\$ 15.06	
<b>PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 2,256.00</b>	<b>\$ 5,194.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 1,749.00</b>	

<b>PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES</b>				<b>NO BID</b>			
1.	500	12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Face	\$ 8.32	\$ 14.70	\$ -	\$ 2.85	
2.	20	30" Stop Faces	\$ 46.79	\$ 30.80	\$ -	\$ 39.45	
3.	20	36" Stop Faces	\$ 46.79	\$ 35.00	\$ -	\$ 34.35	
4.	20	36" Yield Faces	\$ 67.38	\$ 30.80	\$ -	\$ 34.35	
5.	20	24" x 24" No Parking R8-3A Faces	\$ 29.95	\$ 33.60	\$ -	\$ 16.85	
<b>PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 7,978.20</b>	<b>\$ 9,954.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 3,925.00</b>	

<b>PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN</b>				<b>NO BID</b>			
1.	40	9" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ 45.50	\$ 49.00	\$ -	\$ 54.18	
2.	40	9" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ 51.58	\$ 49.00	\$ -	\$ 63.00	
3.	40	9" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ 55.94	\$ 58.80	\$ -	\$ 75.50	
4.	40	6" X 24" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ 29.00	\$ 43.40	\$ -	\$ 29.51	
5.	50	6" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ 35.00	\$ 43.40	\$ -	\$ 36.43	
6.	50	6" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ 40.83	\$ 43.40	\$ -	\$ 43.25	
7.	50	6" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ 55.94	\$ 53.20	\$ -	\$ 50.15	
8.	50	24" x 30" 3M Scotchlite on Aluminum	\$ 55.42	\$ 64.40	\$ -	\$ 43.08	
<b>PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --</b>			<b>\$ 16,640.30</b>	<b>\$ 18,228.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 17,533.10</b>	

VENDOR NAME:

				Central Sign and Fabricating	Sign A Rama Brighton	Unistrut Detroit Service Co.	Signwire Worldwise, Inc.
<b>PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES</b>				\$ 40.00	\$ 100.00	\$ -	\$ -
						<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
<b>PROPOSAL H: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED</b>							
1.	100	12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge		\$ 29.95	\$ 49.00	\$ 21.16	\$ 61.23
2.	100	9 Ft X 1 1/2" - 14 Gauge		\$ 24.95	\$ 43.40	\$ 19.00	\$ 55.90
3.	100	3 Ft X 2 " Base - 12 Gauge		\$ 11.81	\$ 25.20	\$ 7.80	\$ 34.48
4.	100	3 Ft X 1 3/4 " Base - 12 Gauge		\$ 11.95	\$ 22.40	\$ 6.75	\$ 34.48
							See Below
<b>PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 7,866.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 5,471.00	\$ 18,609.00
<b>PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS</b>							
1.	100	12 FT Galvanized steel round post		\$ 28.44	\$ 67.20	\$ -	\$ 50.93
<b>PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 2,844.00	\$ 6,720.00	\$ -	\$ 5,093.00
<b>PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS</b>						<b>NO BID</b>	
1.	50	12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel		\$ 36.00	\$ 54.60	\$ -	\$ 54.53
2.	100	12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel		\$ 29.60	\$ 50.40	\$ -	\$ 47.00
3.	100	10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel		\$ 17.47	\$ 36.40	\$ -	\$ 24.85
<b>PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 6,507.00	\$ 11,410.00	\$ -	\$ 9,911.50
<b>OPTIONAL:</b>						<b>NO BID</b>	
<b>PROPOSAL K: Complete Signs, Single Face 3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000</b>							
1.	50	36" Yield (R1-2)		\$ 67.38	\$ 98.00	\$ -	\$ 71.85
2.	50	30" Stop (R1-1)		\$ 46.79	\$ 126.00	\$ -	\$ 50.76
3.	10	36" Stop (R1-1)		\$ 67.38	\$ 154.00	\$ -	\$ 71.85
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)		\$ 4.80	\$ 25.20	\$ -	\$ 9.60
<b>PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL --</b>				\$ 6,430.30	\$ 12,992.00	\$ -	\$ 6,945.00
<b>ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:</b>				N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
DELIVERY:	Minimum Shipment			\$25.00 per order	\$350.00	Any	\$670.00
	# of Days			5 - 7	14 Business	5 - 10	10 (Average)
CONTACT INFO:	Hrs of Operation:			9 AM to 5 PM	M-F 9 AM to 5 PM	M-F 8 AM to 5 PM	M-F 8 AM to 5 PM
	24 Hr Phone Number:			248-240-0097	810-772-9165	734-756-7756	800-922-6189
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:	Marked			"A"	Blank	MSDS	"A"
PAYMENT TERMS:				Net 30 Days	FOB	1/2 of 1% 10 Net 30	Net 30
WARRANTY:				Blank	8 years	1 yr from defects	1 year
DELIVERY:				5 - 7 Days	Blank	FOB Delivered Our Company Truck	10 (Average) Days
EXCEPTIONS:				Blank	Blank	Proposal H - item 2 1 1/2 SQ 14 GA is not valid - quoted 12 GA	Proposal H-Sizes & Bundles different Prices subject to increase /Cost of Aluminum exceeds
ONE LOT PRICING	Y or N	✓		No	No	No	No
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:	Y or N			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

Opening Date -- 1/07/10  
 Date Prepared -- 1/07/10

CITY OF TROY  
 BID TABULATION  
**TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS**

VENDOR NAME:

Carrier and			
Gable, Inc.			

ITEM	EST QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
<b>PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM</b>						
1.	50	36" YIELD (R1-2)	<b>NO BID</b>			
2.	50	30" STOP (R1-1)	\$ -			
3.	10	36" STOP (R1-1)	\$ -			
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)	\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ -			
<b>NO BID</b>						
<b>PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent Yellow Green</b>						
1.	10	36" S2-1 School Crossing	\$ -			
2.	10	24" X 12" W 16-7 Left School Arrow	\$ -			
3.	10	36" S1-1 Cross Walk	\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ -			
<b>NO BID</b>						
<b>PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN</b>						
1.	10	12" X 18" One Color	<b>NO BID</b>			
2.	20	12" X 36" One Color	\$ -			
3.	30	18" X 18" One Color	\$ -			
4.	20	24" X 24" One Color	\$ -			
5.	50	24" X 30" One Color	\$ -			
6.	50	30" X 30" One Color	\$ -			
7.	10	36" X 36" One Color	\$ -			
8.	10	48" X 48" One Color	\$ -			
9.	50	12" X 30" High Intensity	\$ -			
10.	50	12" X 36" High Intensity	\$ -			
11.	50	12" X 48" High Intensity	\$ -			
12.	20	12" X 54" High Intensity	\$ -			
13.	10	12" X 60" High Intensity	\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ -			
<b>NO BID</b>						
<b>PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS- SIGN</b>						
1.	200	12" X 12" Two Color	\$ -			
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color	\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ -			
<b>NO BID</b>						
<b>PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES</b>						
1.	500	12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Faces	<b>NO BID</b>			
2.	20	30" Stop Faces	\$ -			
3.	20	36" Stop Faces	\$ -			
4.	20	36" Yield Faces	\$ -			
5.	20	24" x 24" No Parking R8-3A Faces	\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ -			
<b>NO BID</b>						
<b>PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN</b>						
1.	40	9" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White	<b>NO BID</b>			
2.	40	9" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ -			
3.	40	9" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ -			
4.	40	6" X 24" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ -			
5.	50	6" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ -			
6.	50	6" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ -			
7.	50	6" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White	\$ -			
8.	50	24" x 30" 3M Scotchlite on Aluminum	\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --</b>			\$ -			

VENDOR NAME:		Carrier and			
		Gable, Inc.			
<b>PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES</b>		\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL H: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED</b>					
1.	100	12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge	\$ 23.95		
2.	100	9 Ft X 1 1/2" - 14 Gauge	\$ 16.90		
3.	100	3 Ft X 2" Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 9.60		
4.	100	3 Ft X 1 3/4" Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 8.83		
<b>PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL --</b>		\$ 5,928.00			
<b>PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS</b>					
1.	100	12 FT Galvanized steel round post	NO BID		
<b>PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --</b>		\$ -			
<b>PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS</b>					
1.	50	12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel	\$ -		
2.	100	12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel	\$ -		
3.	100	10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel	\$ -		
<b>PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL --</b>		\$ -			
<b>OPTIONAL:</b>					
<b>PROPOSAL K: Complete Signs, Single Face 3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000</b>					
1.	50	36" Yield (R1-2)	NO BID		
2.	50	30" Stop (R1-1)	\$ -		
3.	10	36" Stop (R1-1)	\$ -		
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way (R1-4)	\$ -		
<b>PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL --</b>		\$ -			
<b>ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:</b>		N/A			
DELIVERY:	Minimum Shipment	\$1,000.00			
	# of Days	10 - 14			
CONTACT INFO:	Hrs of Operation:	7 AM to 5 PM			
	24 Hr Phone Number:	248-477-8700			
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:	Marked	Blank			
PAYMENT TERMS:		Net 30 Days			
WARRANTY:		1 year			
DELIVERY:		10 - 14 ARO			
EXCEPTIONS:		Blank			
ONE LOT PRICING	Y or N	Yes			
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:	Y or N	Yes			