

Opening Date -- 10/17/06

Date Prepared -- 11/3/06

VENDOR NAME:

CITY OF TROY
 BID TABULATION
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

			Vulcan	Rocal Inc.	Garden State	Allied
			Signs		Highway	Municipal
					Products	Supply
EST	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE
ITEM	QTY					
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE			3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM -			
1.	50	36" YIELD	\$ 18.22	\$ 23.96	\$ 26.02	No bid
2.	50	30" STOP	\$ 25.72	\$ 24.71	\$ 34.04	No bid
3.	10	36" STOP	\$ 37.05	\$ 35.58	\$ 49.02	No bid
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way	\$ 3.49	\$ 4.94	\$ 4.72	No bid
PROPOSAL A: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 2,602.40	\$ 2,838.70	\$ 3,540.40	No bid
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE			3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent yellow green on Aluminum			
1.	10	36" S1-1 School Advance	\$ 70.32	\$ 60.57	\$ 77.63	No bid
2.	10	36" S2-1 School Crossing	\$ 70.32	\$ 60.57	\$ 77.63	No bid
3.	10	12 x 24 -W 16-7 Left School Arrow	\$ 16.70	\$ 14.53	\$ 18.75	No bid
PROPOSAL B: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,573.40	\$ 1,356.70	\$ 1,740.10	No bid
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR						
1.	10	12" X 18" One Color	\$ 5.90	\$ 10.10	\$ 7.12	No bid
2.	20	12" X 36" One Color	\$ 10.71	\$ 20.19	\$ 13.91	No bid
3.	30	18" X 18" One Color	\$ 8.35	\$ 15.14	\$ 10.43	No bid
4.	20	24" X 24" One Color	\$ 14.28	\$ 26.92	\$ 18.54	No bid
5.	50	24" X 30" One Color	\$ 17.85	\$ 33.65	\$ 23.18	No bid
6.	50	30" X 30" One Color	\$ 22.31	\$ 42.06	\$ 28.98	No bid
7.	10	30" X 36" One Color	\$ 32.13	\$ 60.57	\$ 41.73	No bid
8.	10	48" X 48" One Color	\$ 57.12	\$ 107.68	\$ 74.19	No bid
9.	50	12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 11.23	\$ 16.83	\$ 14.78	No bid
10.	50	12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 13.47	\$ 20.19	\$ 17.73	No bid
11.	20	12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 15.72	\$ 23.56	\$ 20.69	No bid
12.	50	12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 17.96	\$ 26.92	\$ 23.64	No bid
13.	10	12" X 60 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 22.45	\$ 33.65	\$ 29.55	No bid
PROPOSAL C: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 6,381.70	\$ 10,970.10	\$ 8,317.10	No bid
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS						
1.	200	12" X 12" Two Color	\$ 4.25	\$ 7.06	\$ 5.62	No bid
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color	\$ 6.03	\$ 10.59	\$ 7.47	No bid
PROPOSAL D: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,151.50	\$ 1,941.50	\$ 1,497.50	No bid
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES						
1.	500	12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A	\$ 1.46	\$ 2.13	\$ 1.14	No bid
2.	20	30" Stop Faces High Intensity	\$ 12.40	\$ 11.03	\$ 13.61	No bid
3.	20	36" Yield Faces High Intensity	\$ 7.48	\$ 8.31	\$ 9.79	No bid
PROPOSAL E: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,127.60	\$ 1,451.80	\$ 1,038.00	No bid
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE						
1.	40	9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 16.31	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.41	No bid
2.	40	9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 19.56	\$ 27.60	\$ 28.09	No bid
3.	40	9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 22.85	\$ 32.20	\$ 32.77	No bid
4.	40	6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 9.07	\$ 18.40	\$ 12.94	No bid
5.	50	6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 11.35	\$ 23.00	\$ 16.17	No bid
6.	50	6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 13.61	\$ 27.60	\$ 19.41	No bid
7.	50	6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 15.86	\$ 32.20	\$ 22.64	No bid
PROPOSAL F: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 4,752.60	\$ 8,188.00	\$ 6,799.40	No bid
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES						
			CALL	\$ 150.00	\$ 25.00	No Bid
			CALL	\$ 150.00	\$ 25.00	No bid

VENDOR NAME:

			Vulcan	Rocal Inc.	Garden State	Allied
			Signs		Highway	Municipal
					Products	Supply
PROPOSAL H; Square Tubular Sign Posts - Perforated - Galvanized Steel - FHWA Approved						
1.	100	12 Ft x 1-3/4" - 14 Gauge	No bid	No bid	\$ 39.18	\$ 19.75
2.	100	9 Ft x 1-1/2" - 14 Gauge	No bid	No bid	\$ 29.38	\$ 15.07
3.	100	3 Ft x 2" Base - 12 Gauge	No bid	No bid	\$ 19.80	\$ 9.15
4.	100	3 Ft x 1-3/4" Base - 12 Gauge	No bid	No bid	\$ 17.82	\$ 8.14
PROPOSAL H: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			No bid	No bid	\$ 10,618.00	\$ 5,211.00
PROPOSAL I: Round Galvanized Steel Post, 2" Nominal Size, 2 1/8" ID 2-3/8" OD., 125 Wall Thickness, 3 lbs LF						
1.	100	12 Ft Galvanized Steel Round Post	No bid	No bid	\$ 76.25	\$ 21.36
PROPOSAL I: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			No bid	No bid	\$ 7,625.00	\$ 2,136.00
PROPOSAL J: U-Channel Sign Posts						
1.	50	12 Ft - 3 lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 31.02	No bid	\$ 40.12	\$ 25.95
2.	100	12 Ft - 3 lbs Green Painted Steel	\$ 24.01	No bid	\$ 29.47	\$ 18.95
3.	100	10 Ft - 2 lbs Green Painted Steel	\$ 12.90	No bid	\$ 19.70	\$ 11.57
PROPOSAL J: ESTIMATED TOTAL			\$ 5,242.00	No bid	\$ 6,923.00	\$ 4,349.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:			\$ 14,888.20	\$ 1,356.70	\$ 1,038.00	9,560.50
DELIVERY:						
Minimum Shipment			\$ 50.00	\$1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	25 pc
# of Days			3-5 days - stock	45	30	30
			30 days nonstock			
CONTACT:						
Hrs of Operation			7:00 to 4:00	8:00 to 4:30	7:00 to 5:00	7:00 to 5:00
Phone #			N/A	704-998-2122	609-774-1116	800-824-0783
TERMS:			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30 Days	30 Days
WARRANTY:			Standard 3M	10 Years	10 Years	---
DELIVERY:			3-5 days - stock			
			30 days nonstock	45	30	30
EXCEPTIONS:			Blank	Listed in Bid	Blank	N/A
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Y or N						

ATTEST:

Tom Rosewarne

 Emily Frontera

 Charlene McComb

 Linda Bockstanz

BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDER BY PROPOSAL

 Jeanette Bennett
 Purchasing Director

Opening Date -- 10/17/06
 Date Prepared -- 11/3/06
 VENDOR NAME:

CITY OF TROY
 BID TABULATION
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

			Custom Products Corporation	Unistrut	Dornbos Sign Inc	Hall Signs
EST ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE			3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM -			
1.	50	36" YIELD	\$ 18.85	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.91
2.	50	30" STOP	\$ 27.86	No bid	No bid	\$ 29.20
3.	10	36" STOP	\$ 40.13	No bid	No bid	\$ 41.76
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way	\$ 4.73	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.02
PROPOSAL A: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 2,784.10	No bid	No bid	\$ 3,063.30
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE			3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent yellow green on Aluminum			
1.	10	36" S1-1 School Advance	\$ 68.16	No bid	No bid	\$ 74.31
2.	10	36" S2-1 School Crossing	\$ 68.16	No bid	No bid	\$ 74.31
3.	10	12 x 24 -W 16-7 Left School Arrow	\$ 15.97	No bid	No bid	\$ 17.39
PROPOSAL B: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,522.90	No bid	No bid	\$ 1,660.10
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR						
1.	10	12" X 18" One Color	\$ 5.83	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.82
2.	20	12" X 36" One Color	\$ 10.79	No bid	No bid	\$ 11.11
3.	30	18" X 18" One Color	\$ 8.72	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.58
4.	20	24" X 24" One Color	\$ 14.39	No bid	No bid	\$ 14.71
5.	50	24" X 30" One Color	\$ 17.92	No bid	No bid	\$ 18.23
6.	50	30" X 30" One Color	\$ 21.70	No bid	No bid	\$ 22.71
7.	10	30" X 36" One Color	\$ 31.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 32.45
8.	10	48" X 48" One Color	\$ 54.67	No bid	No bid	\$ 59.96
9.	50	12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 12.43	No bid	No bid	\$ 12.37
10.	50	12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 14.08	No bid	No bid	\$ 14.84
11.	20	12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 17.45	No bid	No bid	\$ 17.31
12.	50	12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 19.78	No bid	No bid	\$ 19.79
13.	10	12" X 60 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 24.40	No bid	No bid	\$ 24.73
PROPOSAL C: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 6,568.70	No bid	No bid	\$ 6,746.60
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS						
1.	200	12" X 12" Two Color	\$ 5.46	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.54
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color	\$ 6.35	No bid	No bid	\$ 6.47
PROPOSAL D: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,409.50	No bid	No bid	\$ 1,231.50
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES						
1.	500	12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A	\$ 2.41	No bid	No bid	\$ 1.38
2.	20	30" Stop Faces High Intensity	\$ 12.46	No bid	No bid	\$ 13.18
3.	20	36" Yield Faces High Intensity	\$ 8.56	No bid	No bid	\$ 9.85
PROPOSAL E: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,625.40	No bid	No bid	\$ 1,150.60
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE						
1.	40	9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 21.04	No bid	No bid	\$ 29.40
2.	40	9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 25.25	No bid	No bid	\$ 35.16
3.	40	9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 29.46	No bid	No bid	\$ 40.94
4.	40	6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 11.22	No bid	No bid	\$ 16.57
5.	50	6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 14.03	No bid	No bid	\$ 20.54
6.	50	6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 16.83	No bid	No bid	\$ 24.49
7.	50	6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 19.64	No bid	No bid	\$ 28.46
PROPOSAL F: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 6,003.80	No bid	No bid	\$ 8,557.30
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES			\$ 75.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 69.26
			\$ 75.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 69.26

VENDOR NAME:

		Custom Products Corporation	Unistrut Detroit	Dornbos Sign Inc	Hall Signs	
PROPOSAL H; Square Tubular Sign Posts - Perforated - Galvanized Steel - FHWA Approved						
1.	100	12 Ft x 1-3/4" - 14 Gauge	\$ 24.58	\$ 19.80	No bid	\$ 24.08
2.	100	9 Ft x 1-1/2" - 14 Gauge	\$ 16.82	\$ 16.65	No bid	\$ 18.07
3.	100	3 Ft x 2" Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 11.00	\$ 9.13	No bid	\$ 8.42
4.	100	3 Ft x 1-3/4" Base - 12 Gauge	\$ 9.29	\$ 7.44	No bid	\$ 9.88
PROPOSAL H: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 6,169.00	\$ 5,302.00	No bid	\$ 6,045.00
PROPOSAL I: Round Galvanized Steel Post, 2" Nominal Size, 2 1/8" ID 2-3/8" OD.,125 Wall Thickness, 3 lbs LF						
1.	100	12 Ft Galvanized Steel Round Post	\$ 18.51	No bid	Blank	No bid
PROPOSAL I: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,851.00	No bid	Blank	No bid
PROPOSAL J: U-Channel Sign Posts						
1.	50	12 Ft - 3 lbs Galvanized Steel	\$ 30.23	No bid	\$ 30.12	\$ 30.76
2.	100	12 Ft - 3 lbs Green Painted Steel	\$ 22.18	No bid	\$ 19.69	\$ 22.03
3.	100	10 Ft - 2 lbs Green Painted Steel	\$ 12.86	No bid	\$ 10.93	\$ 12.31
PROPOSAL J: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 5,015.50	No bid	\$ 4,568.00	\$ 4,972.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:			\$ 1,851.00			
DELIVERY:		Minimum Shipment	\$1,000.00	\$50.00	Blank	\$1,000.00
		# of Days	7 - 45	5	Blank	30-45 signs 45-75 posts
CONTACT:		Hrs of Operation	7:30 to 5:00	7:30 to 5:00	7:30 to 5:00	8:00 to 5:00
		Phone #	800-367-1492	734-778-9452	517-719-2417	800-284-7446
TERMS:			Net 30 Days	Blank	N-30	0% Net 30
WARRANTY:			Standard 3M	Blank	Blank	Attached to Bid
DELIVERY:			7 - 45	Blank	30	30-45 signs 45-75 posts
EXCEPTIONS:			Listed in Bid	Blank	Blank	Listed in Bid
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:		Y or N	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

Opening Date -- 10/17/06
 Date Prepared -- 11/3/06
 VENDOR NAME:

CITY OF TROY
 BID TABULATION
 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

			Subcon	Michigan State	Electromark
			International	Industries	Company
			LLC		
EST	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT		
ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM -					
1.	50	36" YIELD	\$ 24.71	\$ 87.75	\$ 118.19
2.	50	30" STOP	\$ 34.32	\$ 87.75	\$ 90.31
3.	10	36" STOP	\$ 49.41	\$ 87.75	\$ 163.15
4.	10	18" x 6" All Way	\$ 4.12	\$ 7.80	\$ 34.04
PROPOSAL A: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 3,486.80	\$ 9,730.50	\$ 12,396.90
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent yellow green on Aluminum					
1.	10	36" S1-1 School Advance	\$ 82.71	\$ 105.75	\$ 264.97
2.	10	36" S2-1 School Crossing	\$ 82.71	\$ 105.75	\$ 264.97
3.	10	12 x 24 -W 16-7 Left School Arrow	\$ 18.38	\$ 23.50	\$ 76.56
PROPOSAL B: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 1,838.00	\$ 2,350.00	\$ 6,065.00
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR					
1.	10	12" X 18" One Color	\$ 12.87	\$ 23.50	\$ 39.25
2.	20	12" X 36" One Color	\$ 25.74	\$ 35.25	\$ 41.76
3.	30	18" X 18" One Color	\$ 19.31	\$ 47.00	\$ 47.51
4.	20	24" X 24" One Color	\$ 34.32	\$ 47.00	\$ 125.42
5.	50	24" X 30" One Color	\$ 42.90	\$ 70.50	\$ 77.79
6.	50	30" X 30" One Color	\$ 53.63	\$ 105.75	\$ 91.56
7.	10	30" X 36" One Color	\$ 77.22	\$ 105.75	\$ 121.84
8.	10	48" X 48" One Color	\$ 137.28	\$ 187.20	\$ 218.38
9.	50	12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 13.73	\$ 29.25	\$ 36.95
10.	50	12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 16.47	\$ 29.25	\$ 43.20
11.	20	12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 19.22	\$ 34.00	\$ 59.40
12.	50	12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 21.96	\$ 39.00	\$ 55.70
13.	10	12" X 60 Hi Int W/Round Corners	\$ 27.45	\$ 48.75	\$ 110.41
PROPOSAL C: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 12,147.60	\$ 21,074.50	\$ 26,115.70
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS					
1.	200	12" X 12" Two Color	\$ 8.86	\$ 11.75	\$ 11.58
2.	50	12" X 18" Two Color	\$ 13.29	\$ 23.50	\$ 20.91
PROPOSAL D: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 2,436.50	\$ 3,525.00	\$ 3,361.50
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES					
1.	500	12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A	\$ 2.79	\$ 6.15	\$ 3.13
2.	20	30" Stop Faces High Intensity	\$ 19.50	\$ 87.75	\$ 49.72
3.	20	36" Yield Faces High Intensity	\$ 28.08	\$ 87.75	\$ 65.36
PROPOSAL E: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 2,346.60	\$ 6,585.00	\$ 3,866.60
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE					
1.	40	9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 29.06	N/A	No bid
2.	40	9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 34.87	N/A	No bid
3.	40	9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 40.68	N/A	No bid
4.	40	6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 17.91	N/A	No bid
5.	50	6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 22.09	N/A	No bid
6.	50	6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 26.87	N/A	No bid
7.	50	6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White	\$ 31.34	N/A	No bid
PROPOSAL F: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			\$ 8,915.80	N/A	No bid
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES					
			\$ 90.00	Blank	\$ -
			\$ 90.00	Blank	\$ -

VENDOR NAME:

Subcon	Michigan State	Electromark
International	Industries	Company
LLC		

PROPOSAL H: Square Tubular Sign Posts - Perforated - Galvanized Steel - FHWA Approved

1.	100	12 Ft x 1-3/4" - 14 Gauge	No bid	N/A	No bid
2.	100	9 Ft x 1-1/2" - 14 Gauge	No bid	N/A	No bid
3.	100	3 Ft x 2" Base - 12 Gauge	No bid	N/A	No bid
4.	100	3 Ft x 1-3/4" Base - 12 Gauge	No bid	N/A	No bid
PROPOSAL H: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			No bid	N/A	No bid

PROPOSAL I: Round Galvanized Steel Post, 2" Nominal Size, 2 1/8" ID 2-3/8" OD., 125 Wall Thickness, 3 lbs LF

1.	100	12 Ft Galvanized Steel Round Post	No bid	Blank	No bid
PROPOSAL I: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			No bid	Blank	No bid

PROPOSAL J: U-Channel Sign Posts

1.	50	12 Ft - 3 lbs Galvanized Steel	No bid	N/A	No bid
2.	100	12 Ft - 3 lbs Green Painted Steel	No bid	N/A	No bid
3.	100	10 Ft - 2 lbs Green Painted Steel	No bid	N/A	\$ 14.99
PROPOSAL J: ESTIMATED TOTAL --			No bid	N/A	\$ 1,499.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:

--	--	--

DELIVERY:

Minimum Shipment
 # of Days

None	Blank	\$1,000.00
45	45 - 60	30

CONTACT:

Hrs of Operation
 Phone #

9:00 to 5:00	7:00 to 3:30	8:00 to 5:00
616-304-2208	517-780-6217	315-594-8085

TERMS:

Net 30	Net 30	Net 30 Days
--------	--------	-------------

WARRANTY:

Blank	Blank	Yes
-------	-------	-----

DELIVERY:

Blank	45 - 60	30 Days
-------	---------	---------

EXCEPTIONS:

Blank	Blank	Blank
-------	-------	-------

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:

Y or N

Yes	Yes	Yes
-----	-----	-----