

CITY OF LANSING
 FINANCE DEPARTMENT - PURCHASING OFFICE
 124 W MICHIGAN AVENUE
 LANSING MICHIGAN 48933

BID #B/05/249--TECHNICAL RESCUE EQUIPMENT																														
DEPARTMENT: FIRE																														
OPENING DATE : 4/28																														
BUYER: STEPHANIE ROBINSON (517) 483-4128																														
VENDOR	ITEM 1	ITEM 2	ITEM 3	ITEM 4	ITEM 5	ITEM 6	ITEM 7	ITEM 8	ITEM 9	ITEM 10	ITEM 11	ITEM 12	ITEM 13	ITEM 14	ITEM 15	ITEM 16	ITEM 17	ITEM 18	ITEM 19	ITEM 20	ITEM 21	ITEM 22	ITEM 23	ITEM 24	ITEM 25	ITEM 26	ITEM 27	ITEM 28	ITEM 29	
SAFETY SERVICES, 5286 WYNN ROAD, KALAMAZOO MI 49003-3539	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$431.88	\$147.34	\$75.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GRAINGER, 5617 ENTERPRISE DRIVE, LANSING MI 48911-4194	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.90	\$127.92	\$123.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$119.00	\$87.56	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.52	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$63.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
HAGEMEYER, 3541 STOP EIGHT ROAD, DAYTON OH 45414	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.92	\$131.00	\$158.67	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$392.64	\$121.20	\$93.54	\$215.88	\$107.94	\$35.94	\$35.94
PRIORITY ONE EMERGENCY, 12408 STARK ROAD, LIVONIA MI 48150	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$53.34	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
HYDRAFLOW, 8125 BRENTWOOD INDUSTRIAL DR, ST LOUIS MO 63144	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.10	\$132.00	\$132.00	\$770.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$110.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$81.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ACCURATE SAFETY, 10320 NORTH THOR DRIVE, FREELAND MI 48623	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$415.50	NO BID	\$51.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ALERT, P O BOX 470M PORTLAND MI 48875	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$129.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.20
JACK DOHENY SUPPLIES, 777 DOHENY CT, NORTHVILLE MI 48167	\$2,432.70	\$45.40	\$45.40	\$240.80	\$109.20	\$106.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
DOUGLASS SAFETY SYSTEMS, 4018 ESTEY ROAD, RHODES MI 48652	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$93.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.20
FISHER SAFETY, FISHER SCIENTIFIC CO, 7657 TOBEMORY CT, ADA MI 49301	\$1,965.00	\$44.70	\$43.00	\$197.25	\$91.60	\$108.75	\$16.10	\$143.60	\$165.00	NO BID	\$529.50	\$205.90	\$117.75	\$190.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$588.40	\$104.00	\$104.00	\$335.50	\$38.70	\$85.50	\$238.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LAB SAFETY, P O BOX 1368, JANESVILLE WI 53547-1368	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$156.19	\$969.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$110.57	\$179.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$526.14	\$228.60 + 16.56	\$127.14	\$219.48	\$62.40	\$4.51	NO BID
SUNSHINE LIGHTING, 4821 FIRST AVENUE, BROOKLYN NY 11232	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

CITY OF LANSING
 FINANCE DEPARTMENT - PURCHASING OFFICE
 124 W MICHIGAN AVENUE
 LANSING MICHIGAN 48933

ITEM 30	ITEM 31	ITEM 32	ITEM 33	ITEM 34	ITEM 35	ITEM 36	ITEM 37	ITEM 38	ITEM 39	ITEM 40	ITEM 41	ITEM 42	ITEM 43	ITEM 44	ITEM 45	ITEM 46
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$114.00	\$136.38	\$16.96	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$652.92	\$125.11	\$143.76	\$35.64	\$68.24
\$239.94	\$187.14 ----- \$244.74	\$187.14 ----- \$244.74	\$93.54	\$143.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,964.78	\$4,338.36	\$561.00	NO BID	\$107.07	\$125.94	NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$110.99	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$221.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$45.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$101.00	\$129.90	NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,485.20	\$3,636.60	\$470.25	NO BID	\$118.00	\$166.50	NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
\$374.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$305.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,995.20	\$4,368.00	\$572.00	NO BID	\$115.44	\$127.92	NO BID	NO BID
\$118.50	\$116.10	\$116.10	NO BID	\$148.50	\$2,545.00	\$565.00	\$295.00	\$340.00	\$2,973.00	\$4,356.00	\$582.50	\$3,360.00	\$99.45	\$120.00	\$26.40	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$62.16	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$695.40	NO BID	\$195.54	\$57.00	\$69.16
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID