BID: HEAVY DUTY TRUCK PARTS

Jasper Engines

A & L Systems

Great Lakes Truck & Trailer

Van Horn Truck Parts

& Trans 125415 Glendale Ave 5912 Executive Dr 100 South Street
PO Box 650 Redford, Ml 48239 Westland, Ml 48185 Rochester, Ml 48307
Jasper, IN
47547
PART “A” — Wix Products Make/Part# Make/Part# Make/Part#
The complete product line discounted at NO BID 33% 40% off Jobber 30% off Jobber
Wix air filter #46350 (or) Donaldson P181189  47.20 Baldwin PA2642 37.91 49.97
WIX air filter #42919 (or) Donaldson P181064 22.24 Baldwin PA1902EN 18.31 23.00
Wix air filter #42920 (or) Donaldson P119375 16.92 Baldwin PA1912 11.79 14.18
Wix air filter #51616 (or) Donaldson P551244 43.96 | Baldwin BT8812MPG 25.26 29.89
Wix hydraulic filter #51730 (or) Donaldson P165569 43.90 | Baldwin BT8876MPG 33.39 41.20
Wix hydraulic filter #51495 (or) Donaldson P164384 25.45 | Baldwin BT8850MPG 19.16 23.27
Wix fuel filter #33217 (or) Donaldson P553375 17.34 Baldwin BF1222SP 12.42 19.00
Subtotal Part “A”- Wix Products 217.01 158.24 200.51
PART “B” — Racor Products
The complete product line discounted at 35% No Bid No Bid Cost + 20%
Racor filter R90-P (or) 21.13 21.36
Racor filter S3226T (or) 21.45 N/A
Subtotal Part “B”- Racor Products 42.58 No Bid 21.36
PART “C” — Bendix Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid Cost + 20%
Bendix AD-9 air dryer cartridge (new) K107794S (or) Keene K107794 36.39 26.40
Bendix AD-4 air dryer cartridge (new) K104358X (or) Keene K107358 33.00 35.24
Subtotal Part “C” — Bendix Products No Bid 69.39 61.64
PART “D” — Weatherhead Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid No Bid No Bid Cost + 20%
Weatherhead #12U-516 Hydraulic fitting (or) 7.44
Weatherhead #16U-616 Hydraulic fitting (or) 9.79
Weatherhead #08U-J08 Hydraulic fitting (or) 4.55
Weatherhead #12U-J12 Hydraulic fitting (or) 7.44
Weatherhead #H24508 2" Hydraulic hose (ft) 210
Weatherhead #H24516 1” Hydraulic hose (ft) 4.28
Subtotal Part “D”- Weatherhead Products No Bid No Bid 35.60




Jasper Engines A & L Systems Great Lakes Truck & Trailer Van Horn Truck Parts
& Trans 125415 Glendale Ave 5912 Executive Dr 100 South Street
PO Box 650 Redford, Ml 48239 Westland, Ml 48185 Rochester, Ml 48307
Jasper, IN
47547
PART “E” — SafeWay Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid No Bid No Bid Cost + 20%
S40-4 SafeWay hydraulic coupler (or) 14.93
FF49-4 SafeWay hydraulic coupler (or) 43.25
Subtotal Part “E”- Safeway Products No Bid No Bid 58.18
PART “F” — Midland Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid Cost + 20%
D2A Midland air brake governor (new) (or) 14.65 15.72
BE22020 Midland junction box (or) 7.50 12.92
|Subtota| Part “F” — Midland Products No Bid 22.15 28.64
PART “G” — Dypro Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid Cost + 20%
3030 Dypro brake chamber (or) Carlisle Black Max 39.00 35.40
|Subtota| Part “G” — Dypro Products No Bid 39.00 35.40
PART “H” — Gunite Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid Cost + 20%
AS1140 Gunite slack adjuster (or) 65.88 Crewson Ind 52.74
|Subtota| Part “H” — Gunite Products No Bid 65.88 52.74
PART “I” — Spicer Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid Cost + 20%
S-279X Spicer U-joint (or) PT279 25.60 47.94
|Subtota| Part “I” — Spicer Products No Bid 25.60 47.94
PART “J” — Stemco Products
The complete product line discounted at No Bid Cost + 20%
340-4046 Stemco hub cap (or) 24.00 30.71
359-5912 Stemco hub cap window (or) 6.50 8.32
|Subtotal Part “J” — Stemco Products No Bid 30.50 39.03
PART “K” — Zero Start Products
The complete product line discounted at Cost + 20%
860-0015 Zero-Start block heater for L10 Cummins (or) Jobber  50.44 50.44 46.66
|Subtotal Part “K” — Zero Start Products | 50.44 50.44 46.66




PART “L” — Miscellaneous Products

Jasper Engines

A & L Systems

Great Lakes Truck & Trailer

Van Horn Truck Parts

& Trans 125415 Glendale Ave 5912 Executive Dr 100 South Street
PO Box 650 Redford, Ml 48239 Westland, Ml 48185 Rochester, Ml 48307
Jasper, IN
47547

The complete product line discounted at No Bid Cost + 20%

4” 90 deg. exhaust elbow (or) Walker 41378 20.17 18.91
5” U-bolt exhaust clamp (or) Walker 35775 3.65 2.70
4” U-bolt exhaust clamp (or) Walker 35752 2.56 215
4” Exhaust band clamp (or) Walker 35976 6.64 3.97
4” OD S/S exhaust flex tube (ft) (or) Walker 41691 11.48 6.77
24x30 mud flap (or) Great Lakes Rubber 7.49 5.02
24x36 mud flap (or) Great Lakes Rubber 9.30 5.71
12-volt Auxiliary defroster fan (or) Great Lakes Rubber 38.75 38.40
Subtotal Part “L” — Miscellaneous Products No Bid 100.04 83.63
Cummins Parts (% Discount off list) N/A N/A N/A
Detroit Diesel Parts (% Discount off list) N/A N/A N/A
What is the time frame for delivery of order parts

(hours)? 24 Hours Same Day 1/2 Hour
[Is there a standard delivery charge? No No No
If yes, what is the charge? N/A N/A N/A
[Is there a minimum order for delivery? No Yes No
If yes, what is the minimum order required? N/A 100.00 N/A
Please provide the approximate miles from

vendor location to the City of Rochester Hills 27.3 Miles 40 Miles 3 Miles
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